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Summary 
 
By Ted Hine 
 
The story behind C. Earl Hulburd’s imprisonment for embezzlement in the late 1930’s 
has been learned primarily from the following St. Louis Post Dispatch newspaper articles 
since family oral history about these events was largely non-existent. 
 
While in a St. Louis hospital on Dec. 23, 1938 checking on the condition of his 10 year 
old son, Earl S. “Bud” Hulburd, who had just undergone an appendectomy, Clarence Earl 
Hulburd told a St. Louis Post Dispatch reporter that for the past 10 years he had been 
systematically embezzling approximately $2,000 per month from his employer, the 
Collier Estate and from the related Mary Collier Hitchcock estate for which he also did 
bookkeeping work.  He admitted to taking approximately $100,000 from each entity for a 
total of about $200,000.  During this period his annual salary was approximately $3,200. 
 
It is not clear why he chose the hospital as the location for his admission nor why a 
reporter happened to be present but apparently he used the occasion to provide details of 
the embezzlement and answer to questions. 
 
His theft had been discovered almost 2 months before in early November at which time 
he had resigned as Secretary of the Collier Estate.  He had told his wife and children 
about a month before but, since he had been working with his former boss, Judge 
Hitchcock, to make reparations, the police had not yet been notified.   Evidently Judge 
Hitchcock had indicated to Earl that he would have to eventually go public and 
apparently this was the time and location which Earl chose to do so. 
  
The copyrighted newspaper reporter’s story appeared on Dec. 24th (Christmas Eve day) in 
the St. Louis Post Dispatch on the Front Page “above the fold” (as did the next 3 
newspaper articles) apparently because of C. Earl Hulburd’s social position in the 
community. 
 
Three arrest warrants were issued on Dec. 27th as a direct result of the newspaper articles 
and in spite of the fact that Judge Hitchcock had not notified the authorities of the crime 
and, even after the authorities has learned of it,  had requested that they not arrest Earl till 
after the Christmas holiday season.  Earl was arrested in the hospital while visiting his 
son. 
 
The embezzled funds had gone primarily into maintaining the Hulburd family’s standard 
of living and, upon his arrest, Earl had substantially none of it left.  He had made some 
investments over the years in Illinois oil wells which he hoped would “come in” and pay 
back the funds he had taken.  Throughout the newspaper articles it is apparent that Earl 
felt very sorry about what he had done and that he had wanted to repay the funds at some 
point but, once he got started stealing the money, he felt like he had a tiger by the tail and 
couldn’t let go.  It was apparently very easy to embezzle the funds from his employer of 
22 years since his job was not bonded and no audits were ever performed.  Earl would 
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sometimes forge Judge Hitchcock’s signature or have checks signed by him and then 
change the amount and/or payee. 
 
The newspaper reported that Earl’s wife Hazel had taken to doing nothing but looking out 
a second story window of the family home and not eating or sleeping much for the entire 
month after learning what her husband had done.  One or the other of his daughters, Betty 
S. Hulburd and Harriet N. Hulburd, were sometimes reported as being present with Earl 
at the hospital and/or the jail prior to court appearances.  Learning and having to live with 
Earl’s fraudulent activities must have been emotionally devastating to his wife and 
children. 
 
Earl initially plead “not guilty” at the suggestion of a prosecutor primarily as a means of 
allowing himself some time to get his affairs together before heading to jail.  He then 
plead guilty on Jan. 11, 1939 to 3 charges of embezzlement by agent.  He evidently had 
let his attorney go and thus chose not to be represented by council.  He just wanted to 
“dispose of the whole matter” as quickly as possible. 
 
He was sentenced to 10 years in the State Penitentiary in Jefferson City, MO and his 
sentence was commuted by the Governor after he’d served 4 years and 11 months.  He 
was released from the penitentiary on Dec. 15, 1943. 
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